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TLC’s FAN FAVORITE DR. PIMPLE POPPER RETURNS FOR A BRAND-NEW SEASON 
DECEMBER 21st AT 9PM ET/PT 

  
New Season Kicks Off with Holiday-Themed Special 

  
(Los Angeles, CA) — Back by popular demand, new episodes of fan-favorite DR. PIMPLE 
POPPER will premiere on TLC Monday, December 21 at 9pm/ET/PT with a holiday-themed 
special, DR. PIMPLE POPPER: SEASON’S SQUEEZINGS, and settle in to its new timeslot the 
following week with all new episodes showcasing some of the most outrageous cases yet, 
beginning Monday, December 28 at 9pm ET/PT. 
  
Pop-a-holics can celebrate because the doctor is in! This new season of DR. PIMPLE POPPER 
will take viewers through the powerful and emotional journeys of each patient with skin 
conditions that are preventing them from feeling their best. The episodes will feature Dr. Lee’s 
most challenging cases to date, which were introduced in BEFORE THE POP, which aired 
earlier this year and focused on telemedicine appointments due to the pandemic. Now, armed 
with her splash mask and sensitive bedside manner, Dr. Lee will roll up her sleeves and prepare 
to take on those cases and others, with the hope of helping them to lead lives free of 
embarrassment, while giving them a boost of self-confidence.  
  
Some of the cases this season are so extreme, Dr. Lee teams up with specialists in order to 
provide the best outcome possible. Some examples of what viewers will see in these episodes 
are: an adorable eight-year-old girl—the youngest patient yet on the series—with an extreme 
case of psoriasis who would like to be a dermatologist when she grows up; a man with severe 
keloids on the back of his head and scalp that are so challenging, it will take two doctors and, an 
incredibly rare case of nevus sebaceous that covers much of a woman’s face. 
  
DR. PIMPLE POPPER features Dr. Sandra Lee, one of America’s top dermatologists, as well as 
Instagram and YouTube sensation, as she treats patients with unusual skin conditions and 
helps them to lead a life free of embarrassment-- one needle, pop and scalpel at a time. 
  
TLC is hosting a watch-and-win sweepstakes on TLCme.com where viewers can enter a code 
featured during the Season’s Squeezings holiday special for a chance to win a cash prize. 
  
Follow TLC on Facebook, Instagram, Twitter, TikTok, and YouTube for the latest on all 
things DR. PIMPLE POPPER. Join the conversation using #DrPimplePopper and catch up on 
the DR. PIMPLE POPPER on TLC.com or by downloading the TLC GO app.  
  
DR. PIMPLE POPPER is produced by Ping Pong Productions for TLC.  
  



 
ABOUT TLC 
Offering remarkable real-life stories without judgment, TLC shares everyday heart, humor, hope, 
and human connection with programming genres that include fascinating families, heartwarming 
transformations and life’s milestone moments. TLC is the #1 primetime ad-supported cable 
network across key female demos 
  
TLC is a global brand available in more than 85 million homes in the US and 270 million 
households around the world. Viewers can enjoy their favorite shows anytime, anywhere 
through TLC GO – the network’s TVE offering featuring live and on demand access to complete 
seasons. A destination online, TLC.com offers in-depth fan sites and exclusive original video 
content. Fans can also interact with TLC on Facebook, Instagram, Twitter, Snapchat and 
Pinterest. TLC is part of Discovery (NASDAQ: DISCA, DISCB, DISCK), reaching 3 billion 
cumulative viewers in more than 220 countries and territories to satisfy curiosity and captivate 
superfans with a portfolio of premium nonfiction, lifestyle, sports and kids content brands. 
 
 


