
 
 

‘POSE’ STAR DOMINIQUE JACKSON AND HER FIANCE FIND THEIR  
DREAM HOME IN JUNE 1 EPISODE OF HGTV’S ‘HOUSE HUNTERS’ 

 
New York [May 12, 2021] House Hunters, HGTV’s juggernaut real estate series, will feature 
television star Dominique Jackson and her fiancé and manager, Edwin, as they search for their 
first home. Premiering on Tuesday, June 1, at 10 p.m. ET/PT, the episode follows the couple 
who have vastly different home styles in mind as they tour the options. Both agree they want a 
big place outside of New York City to host their large extended families, but that’s where the 
similarities end. Dominique sees herself in a two-story Colonial with a pool and a glamorous spa 
bathroom, while Edwin wants an open-concept farmhouse and acreage to raise chickens and 
pigs.  
 
“When it comes to buying this house, I want everything,” said Dominique. “We have been 
saving for so long and I think we should just go for it.” 
 
ABOUT HGTV 
HGTV delivers families with relatable stories, superstar real estate and renovation experts and 
amazing home transformations that inspire a passionate audience. For anyone seeking 
entertaining and aspirational home and lifestyle content, HGTV is the place to be. HGTV offers: 
a top 10 cable network that is distributed to 84 million U.S. households; a 
website, HGTV.com, that attracts an average of 10.5 million people each month; a social 
footprint of 25.7 million; HGTV Magazine, a monthly publication that reaches more than one 
million readers; and exclusive collections of home-oriented products through the HGTV HOME™ 
consumer products line. Viewers can become fans of HGTV and interact with other home 
improvement enthusiasts through Facebook, Twitter, Pinterest and Instagram. HGTV is owned 
by Discovery, Inc., a global leader in real life entertainment spanning 220 countries and 
territories, whose portfolio also includes Discovery Channel, Food Network, TLC, Investigation 
Discovery, Travel Channel, MotorTrend, Animal Planet, Science Channel, and the forthcoming 
multi-platform JV with Chip and Joanna Gaines, Magnolia, as well as OWN: Oprah Winfrey 
Network. 
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